Ogemaw County Road Comm. 1
2010 Materials Services
Bid Analysis
Terms of

CATEGORY/ Description #1 Description #2 Description #3 Description #4 Description #5 Description #6 Delivery | Bid Firm [Pmt
VENDOR & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price Lead Time | For Days & Discounts
Asphalt Emulsions HFRS2 OCRC HFRS2 PLANT AE-90 OCRC AE-90 PLANT

Next Day,

Depends on
Bit Mat Products 1.8078 1.7500 1.9078 1.8500 Delivery Price 365 Net 30

One Day,

Depends on
Terry Asphalt Materials 1.9146 1.8500 2.0146 1.9500 Delivery Price 365 Net 30
Bituminous Patching Cold Patch Hot Patch Alternate

CP-5 (MS2S) ‘ CP-6 (MSST) 13A Mod UPM
Saginaw Asphalt 77.00 77.00 50.90 N/A 365 Net 30
Unique Paving Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid 76.00 1-2Days Del Net 30
Corr. Steel Pipe 12" 15" 18" 24" 30"
Class F /Class A | ClassF /Class A | Class F /Class A | Class F /Class A | Class F /Class A
Jensen Bridge 5.04 7.87 6.15 9.47 7.95 11.33 10.18 1497 12.78 18.63 2 Weeks 90 1%10, Net 30
St Regis Culvert 5.10 6.42 6.20 8.02 7.98 9.65 10.68 14.04 13.52 17.55 1-3 Weeks 60 Net 30
Contech Construction 6.20 7.44  7.44 9.23 | 9.30 11.07 1 11.78 14.76 | 14.88 17.45 1 Week 90 1/2%,Net 10
Processed Rd Gravel 23A 22A
Seal Coat Application Single Seal Single Seal Single Seal Single Seal Fog Seal Alternate
CM-90/29A Slag | HFRS-2M/29A Slag| CM-90/29A Agg | HFRS-2M/29A Agg CSSS1H SS1H

C & C Contractors No Bid
Highway Maintenance 1.238 1.341 1.187 1.241 0.290 0.230 6 Weeks 30 1%10,Net 30
Fahrner Asphalt 1.322 1.320 1.278 1.268 0.234 10 Days 30 /Net 30
Seed & Mulch Per Acre
William Lang, Inc. 1150.00 48 Hours Net 30
Weyland Bros., Inc. ‘ 2000.00 ‘ ‘ 3 Days 365‘Net 30
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Ogemaw County Road Comm. 2
2010 Materials Services
Bid Analysis
Terms of

CATEGORY/ Description #1 Description #2 Description #3 Description #4 Description #5 Description #6 Delivery | Bid Firm [Pmt
VENDOR & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price Lead Time | For Days & Discounts
Signs Name Sign 9/24 Name Sign 9X30 Name Sign 9X36 30" Stop Post

Typel 1l Il Typel 1l Il Typel 1l 1ll Typel 1l Il
Rocal, Inc (Warning) 17.28/19.92|19.92 | 21.60| 24.90| 24.90 | 25.92 | 29.88 | 29.88 | 21.81  26.31 25.00 No Bid 30-40 Days 1 Year Net30
M D Solutions (Road)  14.97 15.98 17.72 15.60 16.93 22.07 18.72 19.84 26.17 25.39 29.61 30.27‘ 25.47 4 Weeks 60 Net 30
Dornbos Signs, Inc. 12.78 | 18.35| 27.46 | 16.02 | 22.99 | 34.40 | 19.17 27.52 | 41.18 25.23 23.06 | 44.79 22.08 21-30 Days 365 Net 30
Trucking Rental Tandems Tri-Axles Quads Leads Trains V-Bottom

2.50 3.00 2.50 3.00 2.50 3.00 2.50 3.00 2.50 3.00 2.50 3.00
Maximum Cost/Gal 3.50 4.00 3.50 4.00 3.50 4.00 3.50 4.00 3.50 4.00 3.50 4.00
80.00 85.00 |100.00 105.00 80.00 85.00 Twice a
A D Shell Trucking 90.00 95.00 |115.00 125.00 90.00 95.00 365 Month
80.00 85.00 85.00 90.00 85.00 90.00 |110.00 115.00 110.00 115.00

Fisher Transportation 90.00 95.00 95.00 100.0 95.00 100.0 |120.00 125.00/120.00 125.00 90 Net 30

60.00 62.25 85.00 89.00 108.75 112.75 89.00 92.00
Wangler & Sons 64.75 67.25 93.00 98.00 117.75 121.75 95.00 99.00 360 Net 30

62.00 64.50
Zettel Excavating 67.00 67.00 365

57.50 59.75 74.00 77.50| 94.00 96.75
Dave Bowen Trucking 62.00 64.25 79.75 82.50 | 98.00 101.75 365 Net 30
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